
Trade Training Centres in Schools Program Round Three – Successful Schools Northern Territory 
 

 

*Subject to negotiation 
 

Lead School and 
Cluster School 

Sector Project Name Project Description  Location of Trade 
Training Centre 

Address of Lead 
School 

Funding * 
 

Jabiru Area School 

 Gunbalanya 
School 

Government West Arnhem 
College Trade 
Training Centre 

Funding will be used to purchase two 
transportable workshops, set in two 
prefabricated multipurpose sheds, across two 
school sites in Kakadu. The cluster includes 
Gunbalanya Community School, hosting a 
facility for construction and Jabiru Area School 
hosting a facility for engineering. Students from 
outstations will travel regularly to utilise 
facilities. The sheds include a classroom to aid 
delivery, ablutions and temporary 
accommodation for visiting trainers. 

Jabiru Area School 
 
Gunbalanya School 

Waterhouse Road 
Jabiru NT 0886 

$2,996,915 

Angurugu School 

 Alyangula Area 
School 

 Milyakburra 
School 

 Umbakumba 
School 

Government Anindilyakwa Trade 
Training Centre 

Funding will be used to purchase three 
transportable workshops, set in three 
prefabricated multipurpose sheds, across three 
school sites on Groote Eylandt. The cluster 
consists of Alyangula to host commercial 
cookery, Umbakumba School to host carpentry 
and Angurugu School to host engineering. 
Students from Milyakburra and outstations will 
travel regularly to utilise facilities. The sheds 
include a classroom to aid delivery, ablutions 
and temporary accommodation for visiting 
trainers. 

Angurugu School 
 
Alyangula Area 
School 
 
Umbakumba 
School 

Angurugu  
Groote Eylandt 

$5,538,282 

 


